
JUNE 

2019 
Calendar of Events 

June 1- Sunny Day 5K/3K/Walk, McVeytown. To register, visit 

the Justin Henry Scholarship Trust website. 

June 1- Margaret McCann 

School of Dance spring 

show, 2 and 7:30 p.m., 

Juniata High School, 

Mifflintown. “Let’s Eat” is 

this year’s theme. Tickets 

are $8.50 each and can be 

reserved by calling (717) 436

-9806. 

June 1- National Trails Day, 11 a.m., Greenwood Furnace State 

Park’s Blacksmith Shop, 15795 Greenwood Road, Huntingdon. 

Virtual tour of all of the Sweet Sixteen Trail Challenge locations. 

At noon, go on a 4-5-mile hike where you’ll visit 2 of the 16  

locations of the trail. Information: (814) 667-1800 or Facebook. 

June 1- Splatapalooza, noon-3 p.m., Evolution Arts Center, 121 

Valley St., Lewistown. Come leave your mark on Evo! Paint filled 

balloons will be sold for $1 a throw. There will be tons of     

awesome food and drinks available for purchase. DJ Angel will 

be playing awesome tunes. 

June 1- Music in the Vineyard, 3-6 p.m., Olivero’s Vineyard, 

1271 Troyer Road, McAlisterville. Kenzie McCarter to perform. 

$5 cover.  Information: (717) 877-2238. 

June 1- Port Royal Speedway, 7 p.m., Port Royal. KRS Graphics 

Tri-Track Challenge for late models, limited late models, 305 

sprints and Xtreme stocks; kids bus rides; camera and auto-

graph night. Information: www.portroyalspeedway.com or 

(717) 527-2303. 

June 1- North East Showdown, LCRC Raceway, 29207 Route 35 

North, Oakland Mills. Remote control cars. Information: (717) 

463-9173 or www.lcrcraceway.com. 

June 1-2- Lewis and Clark Circus, 4:30 and 7 p.m., June 1; 3 

p.m., June 2; Millerstown Community Park. Advance      

tickets: $10 for each adult, with one child free with each 

adult. On Circus day, adult tickets will be $15, and          

children’s tickets will be $6. For tickets, call (717) 589-3598. 

June 1-2- Everything Chocolate Weekend, Buttonwood 

Campground, 1515 E. River Road, Mifflintown. Flashlight 

chocolate candy hunt, and a chocolate pudding slip and 

slide! Reservations: (717) 436-8334. 

June 2- Buy Local Art Market, 2-4 p.m., Evolution Arts  

Center, 121 Valley St., Lewistown. Looking for artists to 

participate in a Local Artists Gallery Showing. Booths are 

$10 each. Tables are available. Handmade art only. Perfect 

time to get your art in front of the community. Also looking 

for those shoppers! Buy local while encouraging creativity. 

Message Evo at info@evoarts.org if you'd like a vendor 

app. 

June 2, 14, 16, and 23- Live music, Shy Bear Brewing, 35 

Meadowbrook Lane, Lewistown. (717) 242-2663. 

June 5, 12, 19 and 26- Black Light Adventures, Lincoln  
Caverns. Tour the caverns by black light. Advance ticket 
purchase required prior to tour date. Space is limited. Cost 
is $25.98 per person. Ages 10+. Visit 
www.lincolncaverns.com or call (814) 643-0268 

June 6- Dar Williams speaking 

engagement, 6 p.m., Brookmere 

Winery, 5369 State Route 655, 

Belleville. Hosted by the Juniata 

River Valley Visitors Bureau, the 

event is free to the public. Come 

listen to positive community  

stories that inspired her book – 

“What I Found in A   Thousand 

Towns.” Wine available for       

purchase. 

http://www.portroyalspeedway.com
mailto:info@evoarts.org
http://www.lincolncaverns.com


June 6-8- National Caves and Karst Day, Lincoln Caverns. Free 

activities and crafts for all. Awe inspiring interpretive tours. All 

Pennsylvania residents invited for Ten for Penn. Tickets are all 

$10, all three days. 

June 7- Lewistown First Friday. (SEE JUNE 29) 

June 7-9- Wet N’ Wild Weekend 1, Buttonwood Campground, 

1515 E. River Road, Mifflintown. Beat the summer heat by   

participating in activities such as a water gun battle at high 

noon and a wet hay wagon ride! Reservations: (717) 436-8334 

June 7, 14, 21 and 28- Friday Night Music, 7-10 p.m., Juniata 
Valley Winery, 19175 Route 35 South, Mifflin. Doors open at 5 
p.m. Bring lawn chair, food vendors, wine and beer available 
for purchase. Information: (717) 436-5400 or 
www.juniatavalleywinery.com or Facebook. 

June 7, 14, 21 and 28- Friday Night Live Music, 6 p.m., Seven 

Mountains Wine Bar and Stonefly Café, 6 N. Main St.,       

Reedsville. Information: (717) 667-7089. 

June 7, 14, 21 and 28- Seven Stars Speedway racing, 7 p.m., 

Seven Stars Speedway, 12905 PA-235, Thompsontown. Go-kart 

racing. Information: (717) 589-9976 or 

www.sevenstarsspeedway.com. 

June 7 and 21- Brent Kessler Tableside Magic, Shy Bear    

Brewing, 35 Meadowbrook Lane, Lewistown. 

June 8-Mifflintown Farmers Market, 8:30 a.m.-noon, Bridge 

Street, Mifflintown. Enjoy local music, vendors, food and some 

#communitylove. Live music will be Cumberland Honey,       

presented by The Big Tree Music and Art Foundation. 

June 8- Reedsville Community Day, 10 a.m.-4 p.m., Bender 

Park, Reedsville. Town-wide yard sales, craft and food vendors, 

antique car and truck show, live music, chicken barbecue, Little 

Miss Reedsville pageant and more. Information: (717) 667-6791 

or (717) 250-5020. 

June 8-Grand opening of Evo Treasures, noon-5 p.m.,    

Evolution Arts Center, 121 Valley St., Lewistown. Evo has 

found a dedicated space to share and sell its 'treasures.’ 

You'll find local artists work, repurposed donations,            

up-cycled furniture... New treasures added daily.  

June 8-Port Royal Speedway, 7 p.m., Port Royal. 410 

springs, twin-20s, 305 sprints, and Xtreme stocks.            

Information: www.portroyalspeedway.com or (717) 527-

2303. 

June 8-Derek Heidel, 7-10 p.m., Burnt Timbers Winery, 45 

Fisher Bee Lane, Granville. Jam out to modern and old  

country with a rock twist tossed in. Wine and beer for     

purchase. No outside alcohol. $5 cover charge. 

June 9- Novel Escapes Book Club, 2 p.m. This month’s book 

is “Still Life” by Louise Penny. Activity will be a potluck picnic 

at Greenwood Furnace State Park. 

June 9- Designs & Desserts floral workshop, 2-4 p.m., Lily 

Manor, 19161 Route 35 South, Mifflin. Make a fresh floral 

arrangement with Mylene McClure Yoder and enjoy 

tempting themed desserts. Cost is $40 per person. To      

register, call (717) 994-5648. 

June 9- Juniata Valley Quilt Guild display, 1:30-4 p.m.,    

Tuscarora Academy, 472 Academy Road, Mifflin. Infor-

mation: (717) 436-5152 or 

www.juniatacountyhistoricalsociety.org. 

June 10-14; 17-21; and 24-28- Kids Cave Kamp, Lincoln  
Caverns. Creative activities, crafts, learning and fun. Learn 
about caves, bats, rocks and fossils. Included are cavern 
tours, panning for gems, snacks, t-shirts and Kamp photos. 
Pre-registration required. Camp dates depend on grade  
level. Visit www.lincolncaverns.com or call (814) 643-0268. 

June 11, 18 and 25- T-Rex Tuesdays, Lincoln Caverns. Be a 
junior paleontologist. Fossil and dino workshops. Advance 
tickets available at www.lincolncaverns.com or call (814) 
643-0268. Cost is $21.98 per child ages 4-12; $19.98 per 
adult.  

June 13- Sit, Chat, Create That!, 6-8 p.m., Brookmere     

Winery, 5369 State Route 655, Belleville. Join Daphne    

Marthouse for an evening of mini landscaping. Receive a 

grab-bag that includes a teacup, green or white garden 

bench, a suspended copper wrapped glass marble, twig  

trellis, mini woodland ladder, small fern and tiny flower. 

Cost is $40. To register, call (717) 935-5380. 

http://www.juniatavalleywinery.com
http://www.portroyalspeedway.com
http://www.lincolncaverns.com
http://www.lincolncaverns.com


June 13-15- Tuscarora Valley Heritage Days, Heritage Days 

grounds, Route 75, East Waterford. Benefit/consignment sale, 

quilt sale, tractor pulls, flea market, food, horseshoe             

tournament, lumberjack competition, tractor parades, carving 

demonstrations and a cake decorating contest. Admission is 

Friday and Saturday only. Cost is $2 per person or $5 per       

carload. Visit the Facebook page for information. 

June 13-15- Milroy Hose Co. Community Days, Milroy Fire Co., 

190 College Ave., Milroy. Food, games, music, bake-off and yard 

sales. Open air concert; bring a lawn chair.  

June 14- Seven Mountains Wine Cellars Campfire Friday Night, 

6-9 p.m. Music by Jason Thomas. Food by Smokin’ Hot Butts 

BBQ. Tap take over by Rusty Rail Brewery. Bring your own lawn 

chairs or blankets. Absolutely no alcohol is permitted to be 

brought onto the premises. Information: (814) 364-1000. 

June 14- Sweet Frog Cruise-In, 4-8 p.m., Sweet Frog, Logan 

Boulevard, Burnham. Hosted by the All-American Cruizers Car 

Club and Sweet Frog. All types of vehicles welcome. Donation of 

canned goods for local food bank appreciated. Oldies music, 

door prizes, drawings and discounted sweet treats available for 

purchase. Information: (717) 242-3204. 

June 14- 21st annual Charity Golf Outing, noon, Lost Creek Golf 

Club, 28983 Route 35 North, Oakland Mills. Proceeds benefit 

Make A Wish.  Sponsored by Jack Gaughen Hower & Associates. 

To register, call (717) 436-8205. 

June 14-16- Father’s Day Weekend, Buttonwood Campground, 

1515 E. River Road, Mifflintown. This weekend is all about    

celebrating Dad! Reservations: (717) 436-8334. 

June 14-16-RSTPA Ranch Sorting, Horse Valley Ranch, 4565 

Horse Valley Road, East Waterford. RSTPA sanctioned sorting 

event. Stalls and food service available. Information: (717) 994-

7329. 

June 14- Friday Night Series 1, LCRC Raceway, 29207 Route 35 

North, Oakland Mills. Remote control car racing. Information: 

(717) 463-9173 or www.lcrcraceway.com. 

June 15- Port Royal Speedway, 7 p.m., Port Royal. USAC    

Wingless Springs, Eastern Storm, 410 sprints and EMMR        

presented by sprintcarunlimited.com. Information: 

www.portroyalspeedway.com or (717) 527-2303. 

June 15- Music in the Vineyard, 6-9 p.m., Olivero’s Vineyard, 

1271 Troyer Road, McAlisterville. Ed Varner to perform. $5   

cover. Information: (717) 877-2238. 

June 15-16-Father’s Day weekend at Rockhill Trolley Museum, 

430 Meadow St., Rockhill Furnace. Information: (814) 447-9576 

or www.rockhilltrolley.org. 

June 16- Music for Father’s Day by Steve Summerhill, 1:30-

4:30 p.m., Seven Mountains Wine Cellars, 107 Mountain 

Springs Lane, Decker Valley Road, Spring Mills. Food by 

Smokin’ Hot Butts BBQ. Information: (814) 364-1000. 

June 16- Tuscarora Academy open, 1:30-4 p.m., 472     

Academy Road, Mifflin. Information: (717) 436-5152 or 

www.juniatacountyhistoricalsociety.com. 

June 17-19- Art Camp for kids, teens & adults, 6:30-8:30 

p.m., Lost Creek Mennonite Church, 2682 Long Road, 

Mifflintown. Pre-registration required. Seven class choices. 

Must attend all 3 classes in order to complete projects. To 

register, visit www.lostcreekmennonitechurch.org. 

June 18, 21, 24, and 28- Golden Mile Farmer’s Market, 10 

a.m., Kish Park, 1 Derry Park Drive, Lewistown. Find them on 

Facebook. 

June 21-22-Hawaiian Luau Weekend, Buttonwood 

Campground, 1515 E. River Road, Mifflintown. Break out 

your hula skirts and Hawaiian shirts. Musical entertainment 

on Saturday. Decorate your site for the occasion for prizes. 

Reservations: (717) 436-8334. 

June 22- Wild About Art, 2 p.m., Greenwood Furnace State 

Park, 15795 Greenwood Road, Huntingdon. At the 

campground amphitheater, join Ranger Louie and learn how 

to gather and process free arts supplies from the wilder-

ness. 

June 22-23- Discovery Days, 9 a.m.- 5 p.m., Lincoln Caverns. 
Celebrate 89 years of discovery and Dunlavy family legacy. 
Special historic tours and stories. Free workshops and     
children’s activities all day long. Visit 
www.lincolncaverns.com or call (814) 643-0268 for a   
schedule of activities. No advance tickets or registration 
required. 

June 24-27 Junior Art Class, 2-4 p.m., Evolution Arts Center, 

121 Valley St., Lewistown. Come get creative this summer. 

Work with a new project and medium each day. Pay by the 

project. $20 per day includes all supplies and instruction. 

Check Facebook or www.evo.org to see the days featured 

class. Ideal for ages 6 years and up, but all ages encouraged. 

Send check, email or buy tickets through the website.  

June 27- Summer Family Fun Night, 5-8 p.m., Lincoln      
Caverns. Special interactive themed tours for all ages, fol-
lowed by panning for gems and a craft for the kids. Cost is 
$22 per person. Advance ticket purchase required prior to 
tour date. Visit www.lincolncaverns.com or call (814) 643-
0268. 

http://www.portroyalspeedway.com
http://www.lincolncaverns.com
http://www.evo.org
http://www.lincolncaverns.com


June 27- Passionate for Patriotic 

Décor, 6-8 p.m., Burnt Timber 

Winery, 45 Fisher Bee Lane,  

Granville. Enjoy a glass of Passion 

wine, eat some red, white and 

blue pie and upcycle wine corks 

into an American flag. Cost is $30 

and includes wine, munchies and 

supplies. For tickets, call (717) 

247-8251. 

June 28- Seven Mountains Wine Cellars Campfire Friday 

Night, 6-9 p.m. Music by Hops & Vines. Food by Smokin’ 

Hot Butts BBQ. Tap take over by Neshaminy Creek     

Brewery. Magic with Brent Kessler. Bring your own lawn 

chairs or blankets. Absolutely no alcohol is permitted to 

be brought onto the premises. (814)364-1000. 

June 28- Friday Night Series 2, LCRC Raceway, 29207 

Route 35 North, Oakland Mills. Remote control car racing. 

Information: (717) 463-9173 or www.lcrcraceway.com. 

June 28- Let Freedom Ring Concert, 7 p.m., Embassy   
Theater, 6 S. Main St., Lewistown. Join the band for an 
evening of patriotic music celebrating the music of   
America. Information: (717) 994-1988 or 
sweeta123@comcast.net. Rain date is June 30. 

June 28-29- Horse Valley Ranch IBRA Show, Horse Valley 

Ranch, 4565 Horse Valley Road, East Waterford. 4D IBRA 

sanctioned barrel race. Stalls and food service available. 

Information: (717) 994-7329. 

June 28-30- Wet N’ Wild Weekend 2, Buttonwood 

Campground, 1515 E. River Road, Mifflintown. Water gun 

battle at high noon and a wet hay wagon ride. Reserva-

tions: (717) 436-8334. 

June 29- Health Connections Day on the Farm, 7:30 a.m., 

Hostetler’s Naturals Organic Farm, 260 Stage Road,      

Milroy. Event includes speakers, workshops and lunch. 

Questions about the food industry and human health to 

be discussed. Bring your own chair. To register, call (717) 

248-6079. 

June 29- Liberty Fest, 11 a.m.-11 p.m., Embassy Theater, 

6 S. Main St., Lewistown. Full day of live music, food    

vendors, games, bounce house and classic car cruise-in. 

Feature band of the day is “Felix and the Hurricanes.” The 

day ends with the Juniata River Valley Idol finals at 8 p.m. 

Vendors, volunteers and unique vehicles for the cruise in 

are still needed. For more information, call Dave Campbell 

at (717) 348-0185 or visit the Facebook page. 

June 29- Fourth of 

July Fireworks, 9:30 

p.m., Lewistown Rec 

Park. Hosted by the 

Juniata River Valley 

Chamber of Com-

merce and funded by 

area businesses, or-

ganizations and indi-

viduals. Information: (717) 248-6713. Rain date: June 30. 

June 29- 40th annual Big Valley Bluegrass & Gospel Concert, 6 

p.m., Locust Grove Mennonite Church, 3358 W. Main St.,      

Belleville. 

June 29-Gourmet Popcorn & Wine Pairing, 3-6 p.m., Olivero’s 

Vineyard, 1271 Troyer Road, McAlisterville. Information: (717) 

877-2238. 

June 29-Swamp Root celebration, 6-10 p.m., Hawstone Hollow 

Winery, 11 Hawstone Road, Lewistown. Celebrate the Fourth of 

July at the new campfire friendly Hawstone Colosseum. Great 

place to view the Lewistown fireworks. $5 cover charge. Beer 

and wine available for purchase. Hawstone cooler/AKA Swamp 

Root cooler, will be available too. Bring a chair. No outside     

alcohol. 

June 29- Music in the Vineyard, 6-9 p.m., Olivero’s Vineyard, 

1271 Troyer Road, McAlisterville. The band “Mixed Nuts” to per-

form. Information: (717) 877-2238. 

June 29- Lewistown First Friday. Event moved until end of 

month to join enforce with Liberty Fest. Visit the Facebook page 

for details. 

Painting Parties by Judy 

www.paintingpartiesbyjudy.com 

One West Market Street 

Lewistown, PA 17044 

717-248-6713 

www.juniatarivervalley.org 

June 4– 6 p.m., Burnham 

June 6– 6:30 p.m., Burnham 

June 8– 6 p.m., Belleville 

June 11– 6 p.m., Centre Hall 

June 17-19– 6:30 p.m., Mifflintown, 7 choices of art classes 

June 25– 6 p.m., Mifflin 

June 29– 2 p.m., Mifflintown 

mailto:sweeta123@comcast.net

